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WILLIAMSONARTS
TRADE 

STRATTONVENDOR
TOTALUNIT PRTOTALUNIT PRTOTALUNIT PRQTYBOOK NUMBER

NO BID$790.00$395.00$1,300.00$650.0028/421
NO BID$350.00$350.00$275.00$275.001BCC-012
NO BID$82.00$82.00$650.00$650.001BCC-019
NO BID$69.50$69.50$500.00$500.001BCC-045
NO BID$1,198.00$299.50$1,000.00$250.004BSCV-052
NO BID$712.50$47.50$900.00$60.0015KCC-091

$249.40$124.70$195.00$97.50$350.00$175.002KCC-117
NO BID$267.50$26.75$450.00$45.0010KCC-125
NO BID$1,925.00$3.85$3,475.00$6.95500KCC-126
NO BID$750.00$375.00$1,100.00$550.002KSU-155

$1,064.00$152.00$245.00$35.00$665.00$95.007NYCC-203
NO BID$430.00$215.00$650.00$325.002NYCC-206

$900.00$225.00$288.00$72.00$600.00$150.004NYCC-207
$11,250.00$225.00$1,800.00$36.00$2,125.00$42.5050NYCC-208

$940.00$235.00$220.00$55.00$400.00$100.004NYCC-210
$904.00$452.00$124.00$62.00$200.00$100.002NYCC-211

NO BID$205.00$205.00$500.00$500.001NYCC-213
NO BID$375.00$75.00$625.00$125.005NYCC-214

$130.50$130.50$123.50$123.50$125.00$125.001NYCC-215
$1,448.00$362.00$308.00$77.00$500.00$125.004NYCC-222

NO BID$79.50$79.50$600.00$600.001NYCC-226
$1,448.00$362.00$228.00$57.00$500.00$125.004NYCC-227

$858.40$214.60$189.40$47.35$500.00$125.004NYCC-230
NO BID$390.00$195.00$400.00$200.002NYCC-231
NO BID$2,725.00$54.50$3,250.00$65.0050NYCC-233

$2,624.00$328.00$552.00$69.00$800.00$100.008NYCC-234
$8,700.00$435.00$1,200.00$60.00$1,300.00$65.0020NYCC-236
$1,086.00$362.00$225.00$75.00$330.00$110.003NYCC-239
$7,400.00$185.00$1,354.00$33.85$1,800.00$45.0040NYCC-242
$1,272.00$212.00$325.50$54.25$330.00$55.006NYCC-243

NO BID$1,310.00$262.00$3,500.00$700.005NYCC-246
$3,300.00$275.00$2,250.00$187.50$2,400.00$200.0012NYCC-247
$3,480.00$174.00$817.00$40.85$1,500.00$75.0020NYCC-248
$1,740.00$174.00$430.00$43.00$850.00$85.0010NYCC-249

$380.00$380.00$382.00$382.00$700.00$700.001NYCC-253
$510.40$255.20$165.00$82.50$500.00$250.002NYCC-260
$516.20$258.10$165.00$82.50$350.00$175.002NYCC-264

NO BID$335.00$335.00$650.00$650.001NYCC-267
$450.00$225.00$172.00$86.00$600.00$300.002NYCC-271
$650.00$325.00$158.00$79.00$500.00$250.002NYCC-276

NO BID$425.00$425.00$650.00$650.001NYCC-282
NO BID$808.00$202.00$900.00$225.004NYSC-260
NO BID$4,300.00$215.00$4,500.00$225.0020NYSC-261
NO BID$2,150.00$86.00$2,375.00$95.0025NYSC-262
NO BID$1,750.00$175.00$1,750.00$175.0010NYCV-176-TIE
NO BID$1,750.00$175.00$1,650.00$165.0010NYCV-176-REBID
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NO BID$1,750.00$175.00$1,750.00$175.0010NYCV-177-TIE
NO BID$1,750.00$175.00$1,650.00$165.0010NYCV-177-REBID
NO BID$997.50$199.50$1,375.00$275.005NYCV-180
NO BID$997.50$199.50$1,375.00$275.005NYCV-181(A-Z)
NO BID$997.50$199.50$1,375.00$275.005NYCV-181(A-L)
NO BID$997.50$199.50$1,375.00$275.005NYCV-181(M-Z)
NO BID$1,575.00$45.00$1,732.50$49.5035QCC-306
NO BID$594.00$99.00$1,800.00$300.006QSC-330
NO BID$4,278.75$285.25$3,375.00$225.0015QSC-334
NO BID$1,732.50$38.50$2,475.00$55.0045QSC-335
NO BID$510.00$255.00$1,200.00$600.002QSC-336
NO BID$385.00$385.00$650.00$650.001QSC-337
NO BID$674.00$337.00$1,200.00$600.002QSU-342
NO BID$550.00$550.00$650.00$650.001QSU-343
NO BID$1,088.00$272.00$1,100.00$275.004RSC-360
NO BID$810.00$405.00$1,300.00$650.002RSC-362
NO BID$810.00$405.00$1,300.00$650.002RSC-363
NO BID$4,275.00$285.00$3,150.00$210.0015S-476
NO BID$450.00$450.00$650.00$650.001S-478

NO BID
DODGE GRAPHICS

NO RESPONSE 
JUPITER COMMNICATIONSASIAN IMAGING
DEW GRAPHICSTECH VALLEY PRINTING
TOBAY PRINTINGMOORE WALLACE


